

---

**From:** FOI  
**Sent:** 29 March 2016 08:37  
**To:** Palacky, Alex  
**Subject:** FW: FOI Request. Local Newspapers by parliamentary constituency

Hi Alex – I'm not sure if you have access to the FOI inbox yet so I'm forwarding this to you. I doubt if we hold the info he wants but you can check with Marcus.

Karen

**Karen Cleverly**  
**Business Support Officer**  
[LGBCE](#)  
0330 500 1260

---

**From:** [REDACTED]  
**Sent:** 26 March 2016 17:57  
**To:** FOI <FOI@lgbce.org.uk>  
**Subject:** FOI Request. Local Newspapers by parliamentary constituency

I would be grateful if you would investigate if you hold a list of the local newspapers that serve the populations for each of the parliamentary constituencies? To the extent that you hold the information I would be grateful if you would provide such a list in electronic format, preferably as a MS Excel spreadsheet, or as an Access database file. Please provide for each Parliamentary constituency 1. The constituency name 2. The name of the local newspaper(s) that cover that constituency as a whole or in part. 3. The postal address for each of those newspapers 4. The email address for editorial submissions for each of those newspapers. 5 The website address for each of those newspapers.

Yours faithfully,

[REDACTED]

---

**From:**               Bowell, Marcus  
**Sent:**               30 March 2016 11:09  
**To:**                   Palacky, Alex  
**Subject:**           RE: FOI Request. Local Newspapers by parliamentary constituency

You are right. We do not hold this information.

Marcus

---

**From:** Palacky, Alex  
**Sent:** 29 March 2016 14:50  
**To:** Bowell, Marcus <marcus.bowell@lgbce.org.uk>  
**Subject:** FW: FOI Request. Local Newspapers by parliamentary constituency

Hi Marcus,

I've taken over managing the FOI emails and I've received this FOI requesting Local Newspaper information. Karen said to check with you, but that we probably don't hold this kind of information.

Can you confirm if we do or not.

Thanks

Alex

---

**From:** [REDACTED]  
**Sent:** 26 March 2016 17:57  
**To:** FOI <[FOI@lgbce.org.uk](mailto:FOI@lgbce.org.uk)>  
**Subject:** FOI Request. Local Newspapers by parliamentary constituency

I would be grateful if you would investigate if you hold a list of the local newspapers that serve the populations for each of the parliamentary constituencies? To the extent that you hold the information I would be grateful if you would provide such a list in electronic format, preferably as a MS Excel spreadsheet, or as an Access database file. Please provide for each Parliamentary constituency 1. The constituency name 2. The name of the local newspaper(s) that cover that constituency as a whole or in part. 3. The postal address for each of those newspapers 4. The email address for editorial submissions for each of those newspapers. 5 The website address for each of those newspapers.

Yours faithfully,

[REDACTED]

---

**From:** Palacky, Alex  
**Sent:** 30 March 2016 11:26  
**To:** [REDACTED]  
**Subject:** Your FOI Request: FOI 16/03

Dear [REDACTED],

Thank you for your email of 26 March 2016 requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

You have requested:

**“if you would investigate if you hold a list of the local newspapers that serve the populations for each of the parliamentary constituencies? Specifically you asked:**

- 1. The constituency name**
- 2. The name of the local newspaper(s) that cover that constituency as a whole or in part**
- 3. The postal address for each of those newspapers**
- 4. The email address for editorial submissions for each of those newspapers**
- 5 The website address for each of those newspapers”**

The Commission does not hold any information relevant to this request.

If you have any further queries please do not hesitate to contact me quoting the reference number above in any correspondence. If you wish to request a review of our response, you can write to Lynn Ingram, Finance Director at the address listed below.

If you are not content with the outcome of your FOI request you may apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The details of this procedure can be found on the [ICO website](#). Generally the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted the complaints procedure provided by the LGBCE.

Your sincerely,

--

**Alex Palacky**  
**Office Manager**  
LGBCE  
14<sup>th</sup> Floor Millbank Tower  
London SW1P 4QP  
0330 500 1264

The  
**Local Government**  
**Boundary Commission**  
for England



How are we doing? Click [here](#) to give us your views.